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A simple reverse phase liquid Chromatographic method has been developed and subsequently validated for
simultaneous determination of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in combination. The separation was carried out
using a mobile phase of phosphate buffer (pH-4.5): Acetonitrile (45:55) v/v and using methanol as diluent.
The column used was Inertsil ODS (250 mm x 4.6 mm i.d., 5µm) with flow rate of 1 ml/min using UV
detection at 225 nm. The described method was linear over a concentration range of 5-50µg/ml and 5-25
µg/ml for the assay of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride respectively. The retention times of Pioglitazone and
Glimepiride were found to be4.6 and 7.7min respectively. Results of analysis were validated statistically and
by recovery studies. The results of the study showed that the proposed RP-HPLC method is simple, rapid,
precise and accurate, which is useful for the routine determination of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride bulk drug
and in its pharmaceutical dosage form.

 Download Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simu ...pdf

 Read Online Analytical Method Development and Validation: Si ...pdf

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=3659253995


Download and Read Free Online Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous
Estimation of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC Gagan Sharma, Ravi
Sharma

From reader reviews:

Patricia Howard:

This Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and
Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book will be information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
This particular Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone
and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC without we realize teach the one who reading through
it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't be worry Analytical Method Development and Validation:
Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC can bring
once you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in the
lovely laptop even phone. This Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of
Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC having excellent arrangement in word
and also layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Pamela Watkins:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Analytical Method Development and
Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC
book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred
pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Randy Hunter:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number
of ways to share the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When
you read this Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and
Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC, it is possible to tells your family, friends and soon about
yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a book.



David Dabbs:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen will need book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. From the book
Analytical Method Development and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride
in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-HPLC we can consider more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative
people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suited
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this book Analytical Method Development
and Validation: Simultaneous Estimation of Pioglitazone and Glimepiride in Tablet Dosage Form by RP-
HPLC. You can more pleasing than now.
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